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COURSE FEES & PAYMENTS OPTIONS 
 

PAYMENT 
 

The success of our 11+ programme attracts considerable interest each year, therefore, to assure your 
child of a place on all or any of the phases, full course fees or a non-refundable deposit of £50 is 
required for each course (£100 for Summer School). Once a deposit is paid for a course, your child’s 
place is confirmed. The remaining balance can be settled at any time at least two weeks prior to the 
commencement of each phase at the latest (2 months for Summer School). Please ensure you have 
created an account on our website so that you can keep track of any payments made/due. 

 
COURSE FEES (Pay as you Go) 
 

This option allows you to register for a course in advance without having to pay the entire cost up 
front, giving peace of mind that your place is secure and the financial flexibility to spread the 
payments and ‘pay as you go’ on the remaining balance.  
 

 
Course  Deposit Balance Total Cost per  

Class 
Cost per 

 Hour 

Phase 1 - Introductory £50 £190 £240 £40 £20 

Phase 2 - Preparatory £50 £160 £210 £42 £21 

Phase 3 - Foundation £50 £160 £210 £42 £21 

Phase 4 - Assessment £50 £105 £155 £155 £22 

Phase 4 - Report - - £25 - - 

Phase 5 - Progression £50 £225 £275 £55 £22 

Phase 6 - Extension £50 £225 £275 £55 £22 

Mock Tests  
(2*tests/sitting) 

£150 for 3 sittings 
£120 for 2 sittings 

£60 for 1 sitting 

£150 
£120 
£60 

£50 per sitting 
£60 per sitting 
£60 per sitting 

£25 per Test 
£30 per Test 
£30 per Test 

Phase 7  
Summer School* 

£100 
£495 

(or £545*) 
£595 

(or £645*) 
£119 

(or £129*) 
£17.00 

(or £18.40*) 

Phase 8 – Revision 
£50 £250 £300 £75 £21.40 

Or £85 per session £340 £85 £24.20 

 
*Pupils attending any one of Phases 1, 2, 3, 4A, 5 or 6 receive a £50 discount from Summer School  
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PAYMENT OPTIONS & DISCOUNTS 
 

Advanced Complete Payment (£200.00 discount) 
 

If you would like to enrol your child for the full programme of study, you will be entitled to a 
discount of £200.00. This is the most cost-effective option, reducing the total cost of the course 
from £2,435 to £2,235 and gives you peace of mind that everything is booked, paid for and taken 
care of in advance.  

 
 

Advanced Deposit Payment (£100.00 discount) 
 

If you would like to register for the entire year but pay just the deposit portion, you receive a discount 
of £100. The reduced payment of £500 gives you peace of mind that your child’s place on each 
course is secure but allows you some financial flexibility with the ability to ‘pay as you go’ on the 
remaining balance of each course throughout the year. 
 
If you would like to explore either of the advanced payment options, please get in touch and our team 
will be happy to help.  

 
 

RECOMMEND A FRIEND! 
 

To celebrate 30 years since the School’s establishment, we are delighted to offer a £30.00 
recommend-a-friend discount to all parents of students registered to our programme of study. For 
every friend you bring to Head Start you can claim £30.00 from the cost of any of our courses - just 
ask your friends to mention your referral when they apply and you’ll receive a £30 discount from the 
cost of any course. If you have paid for the course upfront you can claim a £30.00 Amazon gift 
voucher or refund instead! You can recommend as many people and claim the discount/voucher as 
many times as you like! (Valid until December 31st 2025)  
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 


